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Alerts

1 event
44 results matching for 'Innovation Patent Applications Filed' during May 2010.

Number Title Date
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2010100456 A device for covering an item 26 May 2010

2010100467 A Receptacle 26 May 2010

2010100460 Ventilated Bedding System 26 May 2010

2010100475 Ventilated Bedding System 26 May 2010

2010100445 atOnce web 2.0 portal with integrated lead management and feedback loop 26 May 2010

2010100454 Secure Bike Camera Mount 26 May 2010

2010100471 Solar Distillation Device 26 May 2010

2010100455 Water resistant undercast liner 26 May 2010

2010100474 Water resistant elasticized retention bandage and undercast liner 26 May 2010

2010100446 Fridge Door Docking Station for Handheld Touch Screen Electronic Device 26 May 2010

2010100437 Vehicular wheel with replaceable protective ring 26 May 2010

2010100450 The Broard Coil 26 May 2010

2010100447 Combined Spacer and Stand 26 May 2010

2010100453 Cold Storage System 26 May 2010

2010100436 A client assistant process 26 May 2010

2010100432 Collapsible containers 26 May 2010

2010100442 Safety Guard 26 May 2010

2010100444 Improved Packaging with Wrapping Combination 26 May 2010

2010100462 A process for the synthesis of Fipronil 26 May 2010

2010100451 A Vehicle Support Arm Assembly 26 May 2010

2010100441 Emergency Medical Slideshow on a Digital Photo Watch 26 May 2010

2010100435 Portable lighting apparatus 26 May 2010

2010100433 Rewritable card printer 26 May 2010

2010100434 Gaming device including a card processing assembly having a card holders operable with
thermally-printable data cards

26 May 2010

2010100439 Foldable Seating Cushion 26 May 2010

2010100472 Fridge Magnet Book 26 May 2010

2010100449 Fair weigh LNG dispense system 26 May 2010

2010100438 Veterinary composition 26 May 2010

2010100473 Smart card embedded personal radiation dosimeter and reading apparatus 26 May 2010

2010100463 A dental tool for prevention of tooth decay and gum disease 26 May 2010

2010100469 Board stand 26 May 2010

2010100452 Filter for High Pressure Device 26 May 2010

2010100457 A method of matching a buyer with another buyer or buyers for a real estate transaction 26 May 2010

2010100459 Fabric for use in hoarding 26 May 2010

2010100448 Multi-hull Vessel Cross Deck Structure 26 May 2010

2010100443 Underwater light 26 May 2010

2010100464 Natural fiber cup encasing a three dimensional support for undergarments and swimwear
garments

26 May 2010

2010100470 Cam-type pump structure for a refridgerant recycling machine 26 May 2010
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2010100461 Hydrostat 26 May 2010

2010100468 Method of improving airline luggage inspection 26 May 2010

2010100465 A Handle of Detachable Grilling Pan 26 May 2010

2010100466 Grill Device 26 May 2010

2010100440 Improved Rectangular Tensile Structure 26 May 2010

2010100458 Protector 26 May 2010
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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